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47	

	

Alpetieva 
905A 

 

Red round two to five ounce fruit on 
compact dwarf plant. Russian 
commercial variety, sent to the U.S. by 
seed saver Andrey Baranovski of Minsk, 
Belarus. Aroma like tomato soup. 
Heavy early producer for a dwarf 
variety.  
 

Determinate	
2-5	oz	
OP	
Early	
	

Restoration	
Seeds	

NUMBER PHOTO	 NAME DESCRIPTION	 INFORMATION	 SEED	SOURCE	

48 

	

Burpee’s 
Dwarf Giant 

A	red	pink	fruit	that	was	introduced	
in	1909	by	W.	A.	Burpee.	Cross	
between	Ponderosa	and	Dwarf	
Champion.	F.	F.	Rockwell	described	
Dwarf	Giant	as,	‘The	fruits	are	
tremendous	in	size	and	in	quality	
unsurpassed	by	any.	The	vine	is	very	
healthy,	strong	and	stocky.	I	believe	
this	new	tomato	will	become	the	
standard	main	crop	for	the	home	
garden,	try	it.	
	
 

Determinate	
80-85	Days	
10	oz	
OP	

	

NUMBER PHOTO	 NAME DESCRIPTION INFORMATION	 SEED	SOURCE	

49	

	

Burpee’s 
Golden 
Dwarf 

Champion 
 

Sweet flavor. Heavy producer for a 
dwarf variety. Ideal tomato for small 
garden space.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Determinate	
2	oz	
OP	
Late	Season	

Restoration	
Seeds	



NUMBER PHOTO	 NAME DESCRIPTION INFORMATION	 SEED	SOURCE	

50 
	

Dwarf 
Champion 
Improved 

Three to five ounce red slicer on 
compact dwarf plant. Sweeter flavor and 
later maturity than other Dwarf 
Champion tomatoes.  
 
 

Determinate	
85	Days	
3-5	oz	
OP	
Mid-Season	

Restoration	
Seeds	

NUMBER PHOTO	 NAME DESCRIPTION INFORMATION	 SEED	SOURCE	

51 
	

Dwarf Mr. 
Snow 

Dwarf plants with rugose, potato leaf 
foliage and a stout central stem produce 
a heavy yield of smooth, oblate fruits 
with a beautiful ivory color and pale-
pink blush on the blossom end. Meaty 
flesh with small seed cavities and not 
many seeds. Sprightly, sweet flavors 
with a hint of citrus. 
 

Indet.	
90	Days	
5-12	oz	
OP	
Late	Season	

Restoration	
Seeds	

NUMBER PHOTO	 NAME DESCRIPTION	 INFORMATION	 SEED	SOURCE	

52 
	

Inca Jewels These	delicious	“Roma”	style	
container	tomatoes	are	bred	for	
extra-heavy	yields	on	space-saving	3	
ft.	plants.	Ideal	to	grow	in	large	pots	
or	in	smaller	garden	spaces.	You’ll	
have	an	abundance	of	plump	fruits	
bursting	with	juicy	flavor,	delicious	
right	from	the	garden	or	made	into	
rich,	thick,	homemade	sauce.	
	

Determinate	
75	Days	
OP	
Mid	Season	
	

	

NUMBER PHOTO	 NAME DESCRIPTION INFORMATION	 SEED	SOURCE	

53 
	

New Big 
Dwarf 

Introduced in 1919 by crossing 
'Ponderosa' with 'Dwarf Champion'. 
Regular leaf, 2'-3' dwarf plant produces 
lots of large 1-lb., slightly flattened, 
deep pink tomatoes. Perfect for patio 
gardening in pots. Very flavorful.  
 

Indet	
90	Days	
16	oz	
OP	
Late	Season	

Tomato	Fest	



	

NUMBER PHOTO	 NAME DESCRIPTION	 INFORMATION	 SEED	SOURCE	

54 
	

Polish 
Dwarf 

Produces	round	red	tomatoes,	eight	
per	cluster	on	a	compact	2-3’	plant	
that	is	productive	throughout	the	
season.	Donated	from	Poland	in	1965. 

Indet.	
60	Days	
1-4	oz	
OP	
Early	Season	

Restoration	
Seed	

NUMBER PHOTO	 NAME DESCRIPTION	 INFORMATION	 SEED	SOURCE	

55 
	

Tasmanian 
Chocolate 

Strong-yielding,	short,	sturdy	vines	
bear	heavy	crops	of	beautiful,	plump,	
mahogany	red	faintly	striped	
tomatoes	with	delicious,	well-
balanced	flavor.	A	perfect	variety	to	
grow	in	containers	or	small	space	
gardens.	Heavy	for	their	size,	extra	
juicy	and	perfect	for	BLTs,	sliced	for	
salads	or	enjoy	in	good	old-fashioned	
tomato	sandwiches. 

Determinate	
80-85	days	
OP	
Mid	Season	

Tomato	Fest	


